From: Amara Charaf-Eddine <guentis@yahoo.fr>
Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2009 5:13 PM

To: -

Subject: RE: +Algeria and WKO

Thanks for for things done.
| look forward to read you email regarding agreements.
Sincere regards,

Amara Charaf-Eddine
Via my BlackBerry / Mobilis

From: [

Date: Thu, 12 Nov 2009 12:08:27 +0800

To: Amara Charaf-Eddine<guentis@yahoo.fr>
Cc: Amit Gupta<AmitGupta@getaxocean.com>
Subject: RE: +Algeria and WKO

Dear Charaf-Eddine,
The payment is being done today as per your below email. Regarding Agreement | shall send you a separate email.

Best Regards

From: Amara Charaf-Eddine [mailto:guentis@yahoo.fr]

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2009 10:54 PM
To: I
Cc: Amit Gupta

Subject: +Algeria and WKO

| hope you are doing well.

Please find here attached the Draft of the Contract for Algeria as discussed and modified (for your
(Amit) signature and the pre-draft for the Contract for White Koral Overseas, Itd for your advise.

Here are my Bank Account details as | have just received them from the HSBC :

. Benefciairy Bank : HSBC, Singapore

. Benefciary name : AMARA CHARAF-EDDINE
. Beneficiary Account : 152 475877 270

. SWIFT code : HSBCSGSG

. Bank Code : 7232

= . Bank Name & Address : HSBC Offshore Banking Centre
6 Claymore Hill, Singapore 229571

“‘ | will be thankfull if you can order to transfert to this account the (38 000, US$ + 15 000, US$)
I LY

Please advise if any progress in regrds of WKO.
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Thanks and Sincere regards

Amara CHARAF-EDDINE

Mobile: +213.0.661 32 32 11

Résidence Djenan-El-Bey, Villa 21,
23 000 Annaba, Algeria




